
 

The Alderney eGambling (Amendment) Ordinance, 2008 

 

 THE STATES OF ALDERNEY, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 23rd 

day of July, 2008, and in exercise of the powers conferred upon them by section 6 of 

the Gambling (Alderney) Law, 1999, as amended
a
, hereby order:- 

 

Amendment of 2006 Ordinance. 

1. (1) The Alderney eGambling Ordinance, 2006, as amended
b
, is 

further amended as follows. 

 

  (2) In section 6(2)(b) (application costs), immediately before 

“repaid” insert “retained or, as the case may be,”. 

 

  (3) In section 8(2) (fees for licences and certificates) - 

 

(a) in paragraph (b), for “£30,000” substitute “£10,000”; 

and 

 

(b) in paragraph (c), for “£5,000” substitute “£10,000”. 

 

  (4) In section 16(2)(b) (evaluation and testing costs), immediately 

before “repaid” insert “retained or, as the case may be,”. 

 

  (5) Immediately after section 16 insert the following section - 

 

 
a
 Order in Council No. XIV of 1999; No. XXVII of 2001; Ordinance No. XVI 

of 2003; No. VII of 2006. 
b

 Ordinance No. VI of 2006; No.XIII of 2007. 



 2 

“Associates providing core services. 

16A. (1) A full eGambling licensee may exercise its eGambling 

licence only if every business associate providing it with one or more core 

services as prescribed by regulations of the Commission made under this 

subsection holds a current associate certificate. 

 

  (2) Notwithstanding subsection (1), if within 21 days of 

first becoming an associate providing one or more core services to an 

eGambling licensee a person makes application for an associate certificate 

under section 4, until his application is determined by the Commission he shall 

be deemed to hold an associate certificate.”. 

 

  (6) In section 19(3)(b)(ii) (investigations), immediately before 

“repaid” insert “retained or as the case may be,”. 

 

  (7) In the definition of “business associate” in section 28(1), for “or 

management” substitute “, management or performance”. 

 

Citation. 

 2. This Ordinance may be cited as the Alderney eGambling (Amendment) 

Ordinance, 2008. 

 

Commencement. 

 3. This Ordinance shall come into force on the 1st October, 2008. 

 


